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Family Tree 

A limb has fallen from the family tree 

I hear a voice that whispers, “Grieve not for me’ 

Remember the best times, the laughter, the songs 

The good I lived while I was strong 

Continue my heritage, I’m counting on you 

Keep on smiling, the sun will shine through. 

My mind is at ease, my soul is at rest 

Remembering all…how I was truly blessed 

Continue traditions, no matter how small 

Go on with you lives, don’t stare at the wall 

I miss you all dearly so keep up your chin 

Until that fine day we’re together again. 

Floral and Pall Bearers 

Family and Friends                                                
Acknowledgement 

We wish to express our profound and sincere 

appreciation for all your acts of kindness shown 

during the sickness and passing of our beloved.  

It is through your love, prayers, and the grace of 

God that we find strength and comfort.  My 

God bless and keep you all. 

The Family 

Celebrating the Life and Legacy of 

Ms. Willie Ree Harris Gordon 
Sunrise October 18, 1939 - Sunset February 26, 2024 

Saturday, March 2,  2024                                                                
2:45 PM                                                                                      

Christ Community Baptist Church                                                       
1128 N. Ransom Street  | Gastonia, North Carolina   

Reverend Ronald Harbinson, Pastor                                                     
Officiating 

http://www.gregoryfuneralservice.com


YOU WILL ALWAYS BE REMEMBERED . . . 

The Obituary 

Ms. Willie Ree Harris Gordon was 
called home on Monday; February 26, 
2024. 

Ms. Willie Ree was born on October 18, 
1939 to the late Robert L. Harris and the 
late Ruth B. Harris in Anson County, 
North Carolina. 

She worked at Wax Associates for  
twenty-five years and at Pharr Yarn 
where she later retired.  Willie Ree was 
a faithful member of Christ Community 
Baptist Church, Gastonia, North Caroli-
na. 

If there is anything she will be remem-
bered for, is her faith in the Lord,              
fashion, keeping everyone around her 
laughing, and unwavering love for her 
children and grandchildren. 

She was preceded in death by her         
parents: Robert Harris and Ruth B.           
Harris; one sister: Geneva B. Miller;  
two brothers: Robert Harris, Jr., and 
James Floyd Harris, and one grandson: 
Aaron Marquise Harris. 

She leaves precious memories to her two 
daughters: Chris R. Harris and Monica 
L. Harris; three grandchildren: Shana 
Harris Hodges (Derrick Hodges), 
Ayeesna M. Walker, Alec M. Walker, 
and one great grandchild: Kyla; two             
sisters: Louise Triplett Phillip and          
Brenda Harris McClinton; one best 
friend:  Roberta Duff; two special              
people: Dr. Yolanda Chandler and Kris 
Adams and a host of nieces, nephews, 
other relatives, and friends. 

The Order of Service 

Prelude 

Processional 

Visitation                                                      
2:00 until 2:45 p.m. 

Invocation                                           

Selection 

Scripture Readings 

   Old Testament                                            
Pastor Cynthia Stitt 

   New Testament                                           
Pastor Troy Friday 

Prayer of Comfort                              
Rev. Dr. Rodney Freeman 

Selection                                                

Special Remark                                                                                         
(Limit 3 minutes please)                                

 Dana Rose                                             
Catherine Booth Apartments 

    Evelyn Leggett              

 Selection                                                             
Natasha Fewell 

Words of Comfort                                
Pastor Ronald Harbinson                            

Recessional 

 

—Interment—                                            
Armstrong Cemetery                             

Gastonia, North Carolina 

YOU WILL ALWAYS BE REMEMBERED . . .  


